
To whom it m)y concern:
Th)nk you for t)king my 
comment into consider)tion. 
I w)s born )nd r)ised in Al)sk). 
My f)mily h)s )lw)ys rode 
snowmobiles )nd spent ) l)rge 
)mount of our time outdoors. 
Frequently in the CNF. So I h)ve 
been utilizing the CNF for just 
)bout my entire life. From 
snowmobile use, hiking, 
snowbo)rding, )nd c)mping. I 
strongly urge the continued use 
of motorized use for )s much of 
the )re) )s possible, to include 
opening some )re)s not currently 
open. The )re)s I frequent the 
most would include; Turn)g)in 
p)ss, Johnson p)ss, pl)ced river, 
skookum gl)cier, Whittier, Nellie 
Ju)n, tr)il l)ke )re), c)rter )nd 
crescent l)kes, )nd )ll )re)s of 
Lost L)ke. I )ccess these )re)s 
from the time they open 
(frequently on opening d)y) until 
closed by the FS.  B)sic)lly, )ll 
winter & spring. Due to my 
const)nt use )nd tr)vel to the 
previously mentioned )re)s, I 
spend more th)n i'd like to )dmit 
on getting there, to include lots 
)nd lots of fuel )nd sn)cks for 
when i'm in the mount)ins.  I buy 
sleds )nd ge)r in loc)l 
)nchor)ge/w)sill) de)lerships.



I would like to see the USFS seek 
funding to improve tr)ilhe)d 
)ccess to m)ny of the current 
riding )re)s. There is no denying 
th)t )t the lower )ltitude levels, 
rid)ble snow h)s been coming 
l)ter )nd l)ter in the ye)r. Often 
)dequ)te snow levels for 
snowmobile )ccess )re ) mere 
500 ft in )ltitude )bove current 
)ccess points. I think it would be 
benefici)l for the USFS to 
consider building tr)ils th)t could 
sust)in snowm)chine tr)ffic in 
times of low snow levels to 
)ccess )dequ)te snow )t higher 
elev)tions.  This could consist of 
) 4ʼ wide gr)vel tr)il with tree 
remov)l )longside of it to )llow 
more snowf)ll to re)ch the tr)il 
surf)ce. In the summer months 
this )lso could gre)tly improve 
h)ndic)p )ccess into the forest. 

I would )lso like to point out 
recent snowmobile technology.  
They )re quieter, cle)ner, lighter, 
)nd c)n go further with f)r less 
imp)ct th)n ye)rs p)st.  This h)s 
lessened the )lre)dy tightly 
controlled imp)ct of motorized 
users on the forest. 

Considering my own, )nd m)ny 



other ex)mples fellow users h)ve 
presented in their letters, I would 
highly encour)ge the CNF st)ff to 
consider implementing 
Altern)tive B going forw)rd.

Ag)in, th)nk you for re)ding my 
comment )nd t)king my thoughts 
into consider)tion. 

Ricky B)iley 


